Eepublic of the Philippines
Department of Health

Central Luzon Center for Health Development
MARIVEI FS MENTAL WELIL NESS

AND GENERAL HOSPITAL

hdariveles, Bataan

CT AGREEMENT

CONTRA

THIS AGREEMENT made the day of Jume 2023, between MARIVELES MENTAL WELLNESS AND GENERAL
HOSPITAL - P. Monroe St, Poblacion, Mariveles Bataan (herainafter called “the Eniity”) CORAZON VIRAY CRUZ GENERAL
MERCHAMNDISE - Asiafic Market, San Isidro, Mariveles, Bataan (hereinafier called “the Supplier”).

WHEREAS, the Entity invited Bidders for certain goods and ancillary services, viz., PROCUREMENT OF FOOD STUFF FOR 20
SEMESTER 2023 - Beef, Pork and Chicken, Chicken Eggs. Fruits, had accepted 2 Bid by fhe Supplier for the supply of those
senvices in the sum of EIGHT MILLION FIVE HUNDRED NINETEEM THOUSAND SEVEN HUNDRED TWENTY PESOS only
(Php 8.519,720.00) PHILIFPINE CURRENCY, {hereinafter called “the Contract Price™.

WOW THIS AGREEMENT WITNESSETH AS FOLLOWS:

1. In this Agreement words and expressions shall have the same meanings as are respectively assigned o them in the
Condifions of Confract referred fo.

2. The following documents shall be déemed to form and be read and construed as part of this
Agreement, viz.:

(a} the Bid Form znd the Price Schedule submitted by the Bidder,
(b} the Schedule of Requirements;

(c) the Technical Speciiications:

{d) the General Conditions of Contract;

{g) the Special Conditions of Contract; and

{7} the Entity's Notification of Award.

3 Inconsideration of the payments to be made by the Entity to the Supplier as hersinafter mentioned, e Suppler hereby
covenants with the Enfity to provide the goods and services thersin inconformity in all respects with the provisions of
the Coniract as follows:

(Please refar to the attached Notice of Award]

4. The Eniity hereby covenants fo pay the Supplier in consideration of the provision of the goeds and senvices and the
remadying of defecis therein, the Coniract Price or such other sum as may become payabie under fig provisions of the
confract at the ime and in the manner presgribed by the confract,

IN WITNESS whereof the parties hereto have caused this Agreement to be executed in
accordance with the laws of the Republic of the Philippines on tha day and year first above written.

CORAZON |. FLORES, MD; MPH, CESO IV = &

DIRECTORIIV hg (Signaturs over Printed Name)
e WAL CORAZON VIRAY CRLZ GENERAL MERCHANDISE
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Department of Health

Mariveles. Bataan

Tnmldine: (047) 9354617

Central Luzan Center for Health Development
MARIVELES MENTAL WELLNESS

AND GENERAL HOSPITAL

E-mail Address: maili@mmwsh.gov.ph

NOTICE OF AWARD

PROCUREMENT OF FOOD STUFF FOR 2ND SEMESTER 2023

CORAZON VIRAY CRUZ GENERAL MERCHANDISE
Asiatic Market, San [sidro, Mariveles, Bataan

SirMadam:

Jung 27, 2023

This is to inform vou that the result of the Public Bidding for FOOD STUFF FOR 2ND SEMESTER 2023 conducted last June 13, 2023 the following ifams is

awarded to you:
1
FS(E}M aTyY. UNIT ITEM & DESCRIPTION BRAND LINIT COST AMOUNT [
BEEF, PORK, AND CHICKEN
1 1,320 kg Beaaf lean 420.00 B554,400.00
2 5,700 kg Chicken frash, sliced as specified 215.00 #1,225,500.00
3 60 kg Chicken liver 215.00 £12.500.00
4 &0 kg Pork Liver 335.00 £20,100.00
5 10,200 kg Pork lean'stips/ground/porkchep 335.00 P3.417,0600.00
CHICKEN EGGS
1 ] 2382  Tray Eogs, chicken, frash, x-largs, 30 pesiirays 260.00 PA21,920.00
FRUITS
1 4,500 kg ﬁﬁn,ﬁeﬂ,ﬁm,ﬁeeﬁnwmbm, Wiedium size { 45,00 5202 500,00
2 siom| kg [ eh, B ree Romdnsect Bis medium st 65.00 655,200.00
{83 emin sizs)
3 300 box Apple, T_Uﬂpcsmox, firm, fres from insect bits, small size, 1.330.00 2396 000,00
{4 cm diametar)
Poncan, 100pesfbox, firm, free from inssct bite, medium
4 882  box {4 cim diameter) 1,600.00 B1.411 ,zﬂu.unr
**Nothing Follows™ |
TOTAL ﬁ-a,m.?zﬁ.@nl

You are hersby required to provide within ten [10) days the performance security in the form and the amount siipulsted in the Instruefion to Bidders. Failure to
provide the performance security shall consfitute sufficient ground for cancellation of the award and forfeifure of the bid sscurity.

Wery iruly yours,

ZORAIDAF.
Chairperson -

APPROVED:

CORAZON |. FLORE
Director IV

on Bids and Awards

D, MPH, CESO IV

CONFORME:

Lok dell

e of Reprasentsiive




Department of Health
Central Luzon Center for Health Development

HARIVELES MENTAL WELLNESS AND GENERAL HOSPITAL
P. Wownos Stueer. Polincion. Waniveles, Batagw, Plilssines, T05

CTiunkine: +85479554817; Office of the COH: +83478335008 i mal@mmwnhoovnh  Shmnwghgov.ph

¥

NOTICE TO PROCEED
PROCUREMENT OF FOOD STUFF FOR 2% SEMESTER 2023

June __, 2023

M3, CORAZON V, CRUZ
Owner
Corgzon Viray Cruz Ganeral Merchandize

Asiatic Market, San Isidro, Mariveles, Bataan

IMadam:

The Atiached Notice of Award having been approved, notice is hersby given to CORAZON VIRAY CRUZ GENERAL MERCHANDISE that work
may proceed on the PROCUREMENT OF FOOD STUFF FOR 2 SEMESTER 2023 — Beef, Pork and Chicken, Chicken Eggs and Fruits
effective upon posting of your performance security and after the receipt of this notice.

Upan receipt of this notice, you are responsible for performing the services under the terms and condition of the Agreement and in accordance
with the Implementation Schedule.

Please acknowledge receipt and acceptance of this notice by signing both copies in the space provided below. Keep one copy and retum the
ofher to the MARIVELES MENTAL WELLNESS AND GENERAL HOSPITAL.

Very truly yours,

CORAZON I, RES, MD, MPH, CESO IV
Director [V

| acknowledge recsipt of inis Noticson __ JVYEY 1 2023

Mame of the Representative of the Bidder _ m pRIvFRE . JRLA Ao

Authorized Signature:  ——mplelaa

: 2

VisionN MESSION QUALITY POLICY

Marivelzs Mental Weflness ‘We provide and advocate for The Marhveles Mental Wellness and Genersl Haspital s gommitsed to provids
&, and tenaral Hotpital iz 2 fualitemental =nd moedica] affordabiz and quality mental and medics! health care with IntEETIny, InRGvatGn,
canter for specialized health care through promativs, Inelusivity, Compassion, Excallence and Responthensss.
e Ty peyciiatic care with halistic "RRERETEI, CHivE, and e shail ensure compliante with stehrtony and regulatony requirements,
nea_lﬂ-u SErVICEs 10 The pecpie rehabilitative services with We pledge to continuaily improva our Guakity Mansgement Systam 20 sxceed Aul
of Gantral Luzan by 2023, tralning and ressarch, dlients" sstisfaction.

MiiH-HOP-04-08-04




Department of Health

MARIVELES MENTAL WELLNESS

AND GENERAL HOSPITAL

Mariveles, Bataan
Trunlirie (047} 535-4617; Telefay (047) 935-4138
Procunzment {047 5334852

procurement@mmwgh.aov.ph drica Lal M

BINS AND AWARDS COMMITTEE
Resolution No. 2023-477

Approving of Award of Contracts for the
Beef, Chicken and Pork, Fruits, and Chicken Eggs

And Declaring a Failure of Bidding for the
Adult Enteral Nutritional Supplement Powdsr Drink and Grocery ltems

For the Procurement of Food Stuff for 2 Semester 2023

\WHEREAS, Open Competitive Bidding for PROCUREMENT OF FOOD STUFF FOR 280 SEMESTER 2023 was condusted in 2ccordance with
the Republic Act 9184 and its Revised Implementing Rules and Regulations,

\WHEREAS, the Invitation to Bid (IB) was posted in PhilGEPS dated May 23, 2023 and in conspicuous place at the premises of MARIVELES
MENTAL WELLNESS AND GENERAL HOSPITAL compound;

WHEREAS, a Pre-Bid Conference was held on May 31, 2023, 11AM at Procurement Conference Room and/or through webcasting via Zoeom,
Mariveles Mental Wellness and General Hospital — Mariveles, Bataan one (1) prospective bidder attending namely;

1. Corszon Yiray Cruz General Merchandise
WHEREAS, two (2) bidders procured the bidding documents, namely:

1, Corazon Viray Cruz Genersl Merchandise for Beef, Pork and Chicken, Fruits, and Chicken Eggs
2. Jayson and Mayeth Meat Store for Beef, Pork and Chicken, and Fruits

WHEREAS, tn the schedule Submission and Cpening of Bids last Juna 13, 23 OAM. atthe Mariveles Mantal Wellness and General hospital

Compound— Mariveles Bataan, one (1) bidder tendered their Bids, namely;
1. Corazon Viray Cruz Ganeral Merchandizse

\WHEREAS, the original envelopes, containing the Eligibility and Technical Docurments were opened. The presence, completeness and cormeciness
of ihe required dosuments wera cherked and verfied by fhe BAC in the presence of bidder. The results are 23 follows]

{. Corazon Viray Cruz General Merchandise — efigible

WHEREAS, the Financial Proposal of the eligibie bidder were opened. The presence, completeness and comecmess of the entire docurments were
checked and varified by the BAC. The results are as fallows;

1, Corazon Virey Oruz General Merchandise — eigitie

\WHEREAS, the: bidders who were declared *Eligible” and were rated "PASSED" and subsequently thelr respective bids were publicly read and
posted in the Abstract of Bids, to Wit:

| Name of Company Bid Security Form Amount of Bid Security|
" 1. Corgzon Viray Cruz General Merchandise : Bid Securing Declaration MNIA |




Department of Health
Central Luzon Center for Health Development

MARIVELES MENTAL WELLNESS
AND GENERAL HOSPITAL

iflariveles, Bataan
Trunkkine (047} 563555617, Telefae (147) 0354138
Procuressenc [D47] 6334292

procurement@mmwah.gov. oh

WHEREAS no hid offer was received for the llems [ited beiow:

[TTEMNO [ PARTICULAR | Quantity Unit | TOTAL ABC (Php)
ADULT ENTERAL NUTRITIONAL SUPPLEMENT POWDER DRINK |
1 Adultenteral Nutitional 1,464 can ' ]
| Supplemant Powder Drink minimurn of 1,548,912.00
800 gms/can vanilla Savor, with high ‘
' calorie 2t least 260 keallserving and
| protein contentof at least . '
10 gramsfserving |
Delivered quartery (Feb 732 cans & April 732
cans)
Expiry date of at least 1 1/2 years from dale
of delivery

GROCERY

1 Biscult, 10pcsipack, strawberry flavor, choco | 3,800 [ pack
coated . 27807000

crackers wi cream filling

|- energy chooolats cookies, free wacky choon
cookies

- vanilla cookies, crunchy buttered wast
_ strawberry flavored shoricakes w/ honey
- grape fiavored shortcakes wi homey . !

_mango fiavored shortcakes wi honey

~ three wacky peanul butter cookie wafer
sandwich

| —double chogolate sandwich cookie
- crackers plain 250 gms. 10 single/pack
_rich tasting cream crackers 22.5 g single/pack

-finger cream sandwich cookies
Z Broth cubss, natural chicken flavor, 12pcsipack | 240 pack
- . 18,768.00
no presanvative added
13 Broth cubes, naturai pork flavor, 12pesipack no | 420 pack
32,844.00
presenvalive added
4 Catsup, made of banana | 25 | gafion |
§,497.50 |
5 Cheese Spread, 480 grams, Pimiento/Cheddar i bottle
- _ 337410 ) |
6 Coconut Milk Powder, 50 grams 960 pack '
36,540.00 ,
7 | Corned besf, pure beef, 250 grams x 48 cans 8 | case !
| | 22,382.80
B Cup cake assoted flavor x 10 pos 180 pack
| 15.628.50
g Cheese 440 grams 18 pack
1,863.00 |
16 Fish Sauce, iodine fortified, 1L 150 bot. !

| 31500




Department of Health
Central Luzon Center for Health Development

MARIVELES MENTAL WELLNESS
AND GENERAL HOSPITAL

lariveles, Bataan

Trunkiine (047 935-4617; Telefax (047) 535-4138
Peocurement (047} B23-4952

procurement@mmwah.gov.oh

EE T lice drnks, powdered, assomed flavor, | 30 “pack |
minimum of 250 grams | 6,555.00
i
12 Iargarine, Zkg, cholesterole free 24 tub
| _ 12,640.80
13 Marinade Barbeque, minimum of 750ml with | 30 boiile
meat tenderizer 4 968.00
14 Mayonnaiee, real mayonnaise, made with meal | 12 b .
| egg 3.5L. 14 490,00
15 Niilk Powder wilh Iron, zine,vit ¢, minimum of 840 | 420 pack
grams 135.481.50
18 . Milk, Classic, original evaporated filed milk, 370 | 520 can
it 781700
17 Qil, for cooking, coconul cilivegetable ol 240 gallon
137, 724.00
18 Oyster Sauce, minimum.of 750 grams 38 bottls
7.245.00
14 | Pasta, snaghett, gnod quality, Tkalpack an kiloram .
| 3.570.75
20 Pickie Relish, 1 gal G galion
439530
21 Pineapple Chunks, 822gms a0 can
8.418.50
2z Fineapple juics, 2,8 1iter /can 120 can |
: ) 23 480,00
|23 Sardines, 425grams, 48 canslcase easy toopen | 12 cass
34,127 40
24 Sotanghon 1000 grams B0 pack
14.007.00
25 Spread, lver, 85 grams x 46 cans 12 cams
. i 15,856.20
28 Sugar washed, real cans, kg 720 Kilogram
o 48,852.00
27 Soy Sauce, good quality 30 gatlon
5.475.50
28 Tornsio Ssuce, orginat style 1000 grams 200 pack
! 6.000.00
29 Tuna flakes in O 420grams x 24 cans g case
1413120
a0 Water, Mineral 350ml x 35 bottles 18 case
| } 5713.20
WHEREAS, the bid for the items fisted below were found to be substantially complying:
BEEF, PORK AND CHICKEN
ltern No. 1 1,320 kg Beef, lean
| Name of Cempany | Total Cast {ABC) | BID Amount Variance _I
| Corazon Viray Cruz General hierchandise | 576,840.00 | 554,400.00 & |
Item No. 2 5,700 kg Chicken fresh, sliced as specified
Name of Company | Total Cost (ABC) BID Amount Variance

| Caorazon Viray Cruz General Merchandise 1,245,450.00 1,225,500.00 2%




Department of Health
Central Luzon Center for Healh Development

MARIVELES MENTAL WELLNESS
AND GENERAL HOSPITAL

iMariveies. Batazn

Trunkline (047) 935-4617; Telefax (047) 3354138
Procurament (0473 5334992

procurement@mmwah.gov.ph

Item Mo, 3 80 kg Chicken liver

Name of Company | Total Cost (ABC) BID Amourit  Variance !
Corazon Viray Cruz General Merchandise | 13,110.00 12,800.00 2% 1
ftem No. 4 80 kg Pork Liver
Name of Company Total Cost (ABC) | BID Amount Variance |
Corazon Viray Cruz General Merchandise 26,565.00 | 20,100.00 24% !
liem No. 5 40,200 kg Pork leanistrips/groundiporkchop
Name of Company Total Cost (ABC) BID Amount | Variance
Corazon Viray Craz Generdl Merchandise 4,616,060.00 | 3,417,000.00 | 24%
CHICKEN EGGS
ltern No. 1 2,392 Tray Eggs, chicken, fresh, x-large, 30 pesfirays
Name of Company Total Cost (ABC) | BID Amount Variance
Corazan Viray Cruz General Merchandiss B53.480.00 | 821820400 10%
FRUITS
ltern No. 1 4,500 kg Latundan, fresh, firm , free from insect bite, Medium size {9x3 cm)
Name of Company Total Cost (ABC) BID Amount Yariance
Corazon Virgy Cruz General Merchandise 388,125.00 202,500.00 48% _
ltern No. 2 10,080 kg Lacatan, fresh, firm, free from insect bite, medium size (3x3 cm in size)
Name of Company Total Cost (ABC) | BID Amount Variance
Corazon Viray Cruz General Merchandise 1,020,096.00 | 655,200.00 36% |
ltem No. 3 300 box Apple, 100pcs/box, firm, free from insect bite, small size, (4 cm diameter)
Name of Company Total Cost (ABC) | BID Amount Variance
Corazon Viray Cruz General Merchandise £83,100.00 | 399,000.00 42% ]
itemn No. 4 862 box Foncan, 10dpesfbox, firm, free from insect bite, medium {4 cm diameter)
Name of Company Total Cost (ABC) | BID Amount Variance
Corazon Viray Cnuz General Merchandise 2180.74500 | 1.411,200,00 35%

NOW THEREFORE, on the basis of the above, the herein members of the BAC HEREBY RESCOLVE, fo award the items listed below io the bidders
that were determined as the Lowest Calculated and Responsive Bid (LCRBs) or Single Caleulated and Responsive Bid {SCREs),

1. CORAZON VIRAY CRUZ GENERAL MERCHANDISE with Total Contract Price of Php 8,519,720.00 inclusive of local taxes for the

items.
ltem Mo. Description Oy, || Unit Total ABC {PhF) |
BEEF, PORK AND CHICKEN ] ]
1 | Beef lean 1,320 kg P 554,400.00 |
2 _ Chicken frech, sliced as spacified 5,700 kg = 1,225,500.00 |




Department of Health
Central Luzon Center for Health Deveiopment
MARIVELES MENTAL WELLNESS

AND GENERAL HOSPITAL

Mariveles. Baiaan

Trunkdine (047} 935-9617; Telefax ([47) 5354135

Procurement {047) 5334992

procurement@mmwah.qov.oh

Chicken Tiver

il

1290000 |

Pork Liver

&0

20,100.00

[ S RS

Fork lean/sinpsigrounc/ porkciop
- CHICKEN EGGS

A RAR
W

& |5 |5

W] |

3 A ATF FuEy P
o LS E AL |

i Eggs, chicken, fresh, x-large, 30 pesitrays

2392

FRUITS

1

621,520.00

Medium stze { 923 cm)

! . Latundan, freeh, firm . free from insect bite,

4,500

Z Lacatan, fresh, fim, free from insect bite,
medium size (93 cm in size)

10,080

Apple, 100pcsox, fim, free from insect
bite, small size, (4 cm dismeter)

300

4 Poncan, 100pcs/box, firm, free from insect
bite, medium {4 s diameter)

882

GRAND TOTAL

202 500.00 |

655,200.00 |

399,000.00 |

1.411,200.00

8,518,720.00

2. To declare fajlure of bidding for the following items.3

| demNo. | Description

l Qty.

Unft

| Totat ABC PHP) |

ADULT ENTERAL NUTRITIONAL SUPPLEMENT POWDER DRINK

Adult enters! Mutriional

Supplement Pawder Drink.minimum of

800 gms/can vanilla flavar, with high

| calorie at least 260 kealiserving and

1 | protein content of &t least

10 gramsfzerving

Delivered quarterly (Feb 732 cang & April 732 cans)
Expiry date of at least 1 /2 years from dats

of delivery

1,548,912,00

GROCERY ITEMS

1 Biscuit, 10pcs/pack, strawberry flavor, choco coated

pack

crackers wi cream filling

- energy chocolate cookies, three wacky choco cookies

- vanilla cookies, crunchy butiered ioast

- strawberry Tavored shoricakas w/ honey

- grape fiavored shoricakes w! honey

- manga favored shortcakes wi _huney

| -three wacky peanul butler cookle wafer sandwich

| - double chocolate sandwich cookis

- grackers plain 250 gms. 10 single/pack

- rich tasting cream crackers 22.6 g singlefpack

- finger craam sandwich cookies

5]

Broth cubes, natural chicken fiavor, 12pcsipack

pacs

18.768.00 |

ne preservative added

Broth cubss, natural pork flavor, 12pesipack no

420

pack

’7l' w

preservative added

32.844.00




Department of Health
Central Luzon Center for Health Development

MARIVELES MENTAL WELLNESS
AND GENERAL HOSPITAL

Mariveies. Bataan

Trunkline (047) 935-4517; Telefax (047) 5354138

Pracurement (047) 6334352

procurement@mmwagh.gov.oh

4 Catsup, made of banana 2 galion 6.457.50 |
5 Chesss Spread, 480 grams, Pimiento/Cneddar 18 boftds ;:;?£_1 0 |
B Cocenut Milk Powder, 50 grams 860 pack 38.640.00
7 Comed beef, pure heef_, 250 grams » 48 cans ] case 2239260

| 8 Cup cake assoted flavor x 10 pes 1580 pack 15,898 50
8 Cheese 440 grams 18 pack 1.863.00
10 Fish Sauce, iodine forified, 1L 150 bol. 9.415.00
i Jiice drinks, powdered, assontea flavor, minimium of 250 grams 3t pack §.555.00

:'J_: Margaring, 2kg, cholestercls free 24 lub 12640.80
13 I".-'I_aﬁnade Barbaque, minimum of 750ml with meat tenderizer 30 botts 4 888,00
14 Mayannaiss, real mayonnaise, made with realegg 351 12 tub 14.480.00 J
15 Milk Powder with lron, zing vit ¢, minimum of 840 grams 420 pack 135.481.50
16 Milke, Classic, original evaporaied filled milk, 370 mi 90 can 47 817.00
17 (O, for cooking, coconut olllvegetahle ol 240 galion 137 724.0

| 18 Qyster Sauce, minimum of 750 grams 36 botte 7 245.00 ;
19 Pasta, spaghetti, good quality, 1kg/pack 30 kilogram 5 570.75 |
20 Pickle Refish, 1 gal § gaflon 4.395/20
21 Pineapple Chunks, Eﬂ;ms a0 can 941850
22 Fineapple juice, 2.9 liter fean 120 can 93 450,00 |
23 Sardines, 42borams, 48 cansicase easy o open T2 oase 3442740 |
24 Sotanghon 1000 grams &80 pack 14.007.00

_25 Spread, liver, 85 grams % 48 cans 12 cEse 15.856.20
26 Sugar washed, real cang, Thyg 720 Kilograim 4885200 |
27 Soy Sauce, good quality 30 oallon 5 175.50
28 Tomato Saucs, original style 1000 grams 200 pack 500000
29 Tuna flakes in Oil 420grams x 24 cans g case 14 434 90
30 Water, Mineral 350ml x 35 bottles 18 case 5713.20

TOTAL 2328,833.25




Department of Health
Central Luzon Center for Health Development

AND GENERAL HOSPITAL

iariveles, Batazan

Trunkdires (047) 935-4617; Telefax (047) 535128
Procurement (047 ) 5353-4552

procurement@mmwagh.gov.ph

3, Mandate the end-user to review the technical specifications and if necessary, adjust the ABC subject to the required approvals.
£, To conduct 3 Allernatve Mode of Procursment (Small Valug) for GROCERY ITEMS and Re-bidding for ADULT ENTERAL
NUTRITIONAL SUPPLEMENT POWDER DRINK (items cited on Number 2} upon submission of the failowing documentary requirements:
a) Revised Purchase Request (PR)

b) Cerfificate of Availability of Funds (CAF) or Letter of Request received by Budgel

¢} Project Procurement Management Plan (PRMF)

Signed tiis 20th of June 2023 =l the Mariveles Menial Weilnsss and General Fospilal, Mariveles, Bataan.

BIDS AND AWARDS COMMITTEE (BAC)

E W
YINCENT A. 1SIP, MPA MERCED Y. ARADO, RPh, MPA
BAC Member BAC iiember
REL %Eﬁﬁss RN, MAN LEA-JEA ONG, MBA
BAC Member BAC Vice-Chairpersen
ZORAIDA F. AFABLE, MD
BAC Chairperson

APPRO

CORAZON |. FLORESAMD, MPH, CESO IV



FOOD STUFF for bid for the Six {§) Months Procurement 2023

MARIVELES MENTAL WELLNESS AND GENERAL HOSPITAL

Marivales, Eaiaan

Procurement of Food Stuff for 2nd Semester 2023

ITEM ABC o~ Virs
ARTICLES & DESCRIFTION aTy. Unit «-1-:0!‘&20!1 o
- : : Unit Cost| Totsl Amount | ™% Gemeral | UNIT COST| AMOUNT |
Merchandise
BEEF, PORK AND CHICKEN
1 |Beef, lean 1,320 kg 437.00 29,840.00 420,00 554 400.00 |
2 |Chicken fresh, sliced 5 specified 5700 K3 218.50]  1,24545000 21503 1,225500.00 ;
3 1Chicken liver 60 kg 218.50 13.118.00 21500 12.200.00
4 |Pork Liver i kg 44375 26,565.00 33540 20.100.00
5 |Paork lean'stips/ground porkchop 10,200) kg 44275 451605000 335001 3A417.000.00
\ €,378,015.00 §,229,300.00 |
CHICKEN EGGS  _ !
1 | Eags, chicken, fresh,~#=dium, 30 pesitrays 239%2] Tray 290.00]  693.680.00 260.00] 62182000
653,680.00 621.520.00 |
ADULT ENTERAL NUTRITIONAL SUPPLEMENT I
POWDER DRINK :
Adutt enteral Nutmtions! |
Supptement Powder Bnslc sainimara of [
304 gms/can vanilia flawor, with high
calorie atlagst 260 keallsering arnd
1 |protein content of at least 1.484)  can 1.058.000  1,548.912.00 Mo Bid
1% gramsizaning !
Delivered quartery (Feh 732 cans & April 732 cans) :
Expiny-iiate ol at least 1 112 years frop date |
of delivery '
| [
1,548,912.00|
FRUITS |
Latndan, fresh, firm |, fres fom inseot bite. Mediam size { 932
! lems ' \ 4500| kg 8625 38812500 4500 |  2025600.00
Lacatan, fresh, firm, free 1 ct bite, medium size (93
2 e R st m e e | sl kg 101.20|  1,020,096.00| 8500 |  655.200.00
Apple, 100pcs/box, firm, free from insect bite, small size, (4 Y
i Bl e i S T L 300 box | 2277.00]  683100.00 133000 |  399.000.00
diameter)
Poncan, 100pcaibo; firm, free from i £ bite, medium (4 z -
s | s TN R Re ROPIRGE s e MR L o 882| box | 247250 2,180745.00 1,600,00 | 1,411,200.00
LR ] i
4,272,066.00 2,667,900.00 |
GROCERY | '
| Biseuit, 1Up_c&fp_ap_l_n._ strawherry flavor, choco coated 3.900| pack 7130 2re.070.00 No Bid
crackers w/ cream filling
- rnerny chncolate conkies, three wacky choen cookies |
- varilla cookies, crunchy buttered loast
- sfawbeny fiavored shortcakes wi honay
- grape flavored shorlcakes wi honey
- mango fiavored shortcakes w honey
- three wacky peanut bulter cookie wafer sandwich
- double chocolate sandwich cookie '
- creckers olsin 250 gme. 10 singleteack i
- rich tasting cream crackers 22,8 g singleipack :
- finger cream sandwach cookies |
2 | Broth cubes, natural chicken flavor, 12pcsipack 240| pack 7820 18 7E8.00 Ne Bid |
nio preservative added |
3 | Broth cubes. natural pork flaver, 12pcsinack no 4201 pack 7820 32 5440 Mo Bid |
prasaTvative added |
& Calsip madecihanans 2l galien 28000 BAST Y No Bid {
5 | Cheese Spread, 480 grams, Pimiento/Cheddar 18] botlle 13745 3.3T4.1ﬂl Mg Bid
Coconut Milk Powder. 50 grams 960 pack 4525 38,640.00] No Bid




FOOD STUFF for bid for tha Six (6) Moniths Procurement 2023

MARIVELES MENTAL WELLNESS AND GENERAL HOSPITAL
Marveles, Eataan

Procurement of Food Stuff for 2nd Semester 2023

$60,021.25|

e ABC Corazon Viray —I
P ARTICLES & DESCRIPTION QTY. Unit Unit Cost| Totmi Amour{ iz General [UNITCOST| AMOUNT '
Merchandise _j
7 Corred west, pure Dest, 250 grams x 48 cans 8 case 275540 22,252 84 NeBi
B | Cupcake assoted flavorx 10 pes 180 pack #6.83 15,828.50 No Bid
§ | Cheess 440 grams 18] pack 102.50 1,863.00 No Bid ,
10 | Fish Sauce, iodine fortified, 1L 8 _ 60] bot |  e248]  931500]  NoBid —
11 | Juice drinks, powdersd, assorted flaver, minimum of 250 grams 30| pack 218,50 6,555.00 Mo Bid
12 | Margarine, 2kg, chclesterole fres 24| tub 526 70 12,640.80 No Bid [
13. | Marinade Barbeque, minimum of 750ml with meat tenderizer 30| botle 165.60 4.858.00 Mo Bid .
14 | Mayonnaise, real mayonnaise, made with real egg 3.5 L 121 b 1,207 .50 1449000 e Bid 5
13 | Witk Powder with lron, zinc.vit ¢, minimum of 840 grams 420]  pack 322 58 135.481.50 Mo Bid I
16 | Wik, Classic, original evaporated flled milk, 370 ml 9900 can 4830 47.817.00 No Bid |
17 | O, for cosling, coconut oifvsatable of 20 gelon | 57385 13772400 Ne Bid |
18 | Oyster Sauce. minimum of 750 grams 38| botils 201.25 7.245.00 No Bid '
16 | Pasta, spaghstt, good quality, Thaipack 30] idogram{  199.03 3500.75 No Bid '
20 | Pickie Relish, 1 gal & gaflon 13255 435530 Mo Bid
_21 | Pineapple Chunks, §22gms 80| can 10465 941850 Mo Bid
22 | Pineapple iliice. 2.8 liter lcan 1200 can 195,50 23.460,00 No Bid
23 | Sardines, 425grams, 48 cansicass easy 10 open 12| case | 284395 34,127.40 No Bid
24 1 Scianghon 1000 grams £0 i Zaads 12.007.00 No Bid
75 | Spread, liver, 85 grams x 48 cans 12| case | 132135 15,356.20 No Bid
%6 | Sugarwashed, resl cane, Tkg T2l kilogram 6785 48 852 00 Mo Bid
27 | Soy Sauce, good quality Ee— 4 =) 3] gsllon 20585 617550 Mo Bid
28 | Tomalo Sauce, original sivle 1000 grams ) 200 pack 30,00 8:000.00 No Bid |
29 | Tuna fakes in O 4200rams x 24 rans 6l rase | 2735500 14,131 20 No Bid |
30 | Water, Mineral 350mi x 35 bottles 18] case | 31740 571320 No Bid ]I
|

End-ldzer




